
ALTO PIANO SOFA



2

Altopiano is a range of sofas that 
includes the two-seater and three-
seater sofas and a large armchair with 
square legs incorporated to the 
upholstered part, a “stepped” side 
profile and square lines with tight 
covering combined with soft parts.

These features make the product 
elegant, elaborately detailed and, at 
the same time, comfortable and 
inviting. The leather or fabric 
upholstery covering the whole sofa 
has been carefully tailored.

Simple lines and high-quality materials 
distinguish this sofa covered with 
leather or fabric and available in 
different dimensions.

The sofa can be realized also without 
armrests and can be combined with 
two different base models: the metal 
legs or the wooden base Moderato.

The wide range of fabrics in different 
colors and leathers allows to realize a 
sofa that meet the taste of every single 
client.
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DIMENSIONS
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VELVETS
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PIXEL LEATHERS

NUBUCK
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SKIN LEATHERS

SWING LEATHERS
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TOSCA LEATHERS



1060 Kane Concourse, Bay Harbor Islands, FL 33154

www.materiacollection.com | info@materiacollection.com

1-800-849-4953  | 786-438-1330

U.S.A HEADQUARTERS


