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Symphony is a fully customizable 
double bed composed of modular 
elements that can be realized in 
different finishes and allow you to 
design both traditional and corner 
compositions with great flexibility in 
terms of look and feel.

The essential characteristic of 
Symphony double bed is the 
possibility of being configured in 
different combinations thanks to its 
multiple modules and wide range of 
finishes.

The various finishes available for the 
headboard characterize the taste and 
aesthetics of this bed system 
conceived in continuity with the 
"Symphony" storage system, 
designed for the living space.

SYMPHONY BED 
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Symphony double bed configured in 
corner composition with Calacatta 
marble structure and nubuck leather 
headboard is the protagonist of this 
elegant and finely decorated bedroom.
 
Symphony bed features a series of 
accessories such as the round side 
table and the square shelf. 

The simple lines of the Symphony bed 
hide refined details, precious materials 
and a distinguishing handmade touch.

The base of the bed is thin and low, 
almost invisible behind the thick 
mattress.

The Symphony program includes also 
a range of benches configurable with 
self- standing walls that can be used 
as TV units.



5



6



7



8



9



10

POSSIBLE CONFIGURATIONS

SY 10 SYMPHONY BED SY 11 SYMPHONY BED

SY 12 SYMPHONY BED SY 13 SYMPHONY BED
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ACCESSORIES 
SY 21 NICHE SHELF 

SY 22  NICHE SHELF 

SY 23 NICHE SHELF 
SY 24 NICHE SHELF 

SY 26 TURNING TABLE  SY 25 SHELF 



FINISHES
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SATIN CERAMICS

POLISHED CERAMICS



FINISHES
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PLAIN WOODS



FINISHES
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DYED WOODS

BRUSHED MATT LACQUERED



FINISHES
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LACCA 61



FINISHES
NUBUCK LEATHER 
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FINISHES
NUBUCK LEATHER 
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FINISHES

CLOUD LEATHER 

MONTANA LEATHER 

18



FINISHES

SAVANA LEATHER 
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FINISHES

MATT VELVETS LARIO
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FINISHES

MATT VELVETS LARIO
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FINISHES
MATT VELVETS LARIO
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FINISHES
MATT VELVETS LARIO
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FINISHES
SHINY VELVETS ROXANA
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FINISHES
SHINY VELVETS ROXANA
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1060 Kane Concourse, Bay Harbor Islands, FL 33154 786-438-1330

www.materiacollection.com | info@materiacollection.com

800-849-4953267 5th Ave, #504, New York, NY 10016

http://www.materiacollection.com/
https://www.google.com/maps/place/MATERIA+Collection/@25.8865683,-80.1306528,15z/data=!4m5!3m4!1s0x0:0x5501b38c3a1393d8!8m2!3d25.8865683!4d-80.1306528
http://www.materiacollection.com/
mailto:info@materiacollection.com
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCIO2S9YRHMY1axGKwMSy7XQ
https://www.facebook.com/MATERIACollection/
https://www.instagram.com/materiacollection/
https://www.pinterest.com/materia_collection/
http://www.materiacollection.com/

